
willowcroft regal emblem

Willowcroft Regal Emblem boasts the most sensational 
breeding in the country with siblings and his world famous 
progeny representative of the breed within Australia, UK, 
NZ, Asia and beyond. Emblems full brother Willocroft Regal 
Bronze stands at Stud in the UK at Stanley Grange Stud.

Whether it’s at Grand Nationals or Royal Shows across Australia 
or on the Queens lawn at Windsor castle, Willowcroft Regal 
Emblem has stamped his infamous movement, conformation, 
and temperament and true show ring presence on his progeny.

Emblem is out of the muti award winning mare Willowcroft 
Saphire, herself claiming the accolades of Championships at 
Melbourne, Adelaide, and Sydney Royals within one season. 
The incredible “Mary Pinsent’ bronze Trophy for Supreme 
Riding Pony at Sydney Royal is a replica of this infamous mare.

Emblems sire line Urubula Regal Promise has stamped the 
incredible breeding lines within Australia, with the production 
of many high end show horses, and a strong and consistent 
breeding type.

Emblem epitomizes the true riding pony type, at 14.2 hh he is 
rare in that most stallions of this size are largely thoroughbred 
breeding whilst Emblem boasts 7/8 imported Riding Pony. 
Thus breeding a beautiful ridden saddle or led show or 
performance horse. 

His outstanding progeny are too numerous to cite however 
notably: Willowcroft Miss Money Penny (multiple Royal  
Show winner and dam of W. Coco Chanel and W. Miss 
Saigon), Diridgeree Park Regal Minetta (Royal Show winner), 
Willowcroft Winter Angel (Multiple Royal Shows), 
Willowcroft High Society, Naaman Uptown Girl,  
Willowcroft Secret Affair, and Black Diamond.


